MARKET MAKING AGREEMENT

THIS AGREEMENT is entered into as of the Effective Date.

BETWEEN:

AND:

WITH THE
INTERVENTION OF:

BOURSE DE MONTREAL INC., a corporation incorporated under the
laws of Québec, having its head office at 1800 - 1190 avenue des
Canadiens-de-Montréal, C. P. 37, Montréal, Québec, H3B 0G7, Canada,
represented by Robert Tasca, Managing Director, Derivatives Products and
Serivices

(the “Bourse”)

[INAME OF MARKET MAKER], a [corporation, limited liability
company or other]\ incorporated under the laws of ][jurisdiction], having its
head office at [address], represented by [name], its [title]

(the “Market Maker”)

CANADIAN DERIVATIVES CLEARING CORPORATION, a
corporation incorporated under the laws of Canada, having its head office
at 1800 - 1190 avenue des Canadiens-de-Montréal, C. P. 37, Montréal,
Québec, H3B 0G7, Canada, Jean-Francois Bertrand, its Chief Operating
Officer

(CCCDCC79)

WHEREAS the Bourse is a derivatives exchange and CDCC is the clearing house providing clearing
services for all products traded on the Bourse;

WHEREAS the Bourse establishes market making programs from time to time in order to support and
enhance liquidity and price discovery of its products;

WHEREAS the Market Maker intends to fulfill market making responsibilities and benefit from market
making privileges with respect to the Designated Contracts;

WHEREAS CDCC may, in addition to those provided by the Bourse, provide Incentives with respect to
clearing fees in consideration for the Market Maker’s responsibilities;

The Parties therefore agree as follows:



ARTICLE 1
GENERAL

1.1.  Definitions

Unless the context otherwise requires, all capitalized terms used in this Agreement and not defined herein
shall have the meaning ascribed thereto under the Rules. In addition, in this Agreement, the following
definitions apply:

(2)

(b)

(©)

(d)

(e)

®

(2

(h)

(1)

@

“Affiliates” means with respect to any Party, any and all other Person directly or indirectly
controlling or controlled by, or under common direct or indirect control with, such Party;

“Agreement” means this Agreement and all schedules attached to this Agreement, in each
case as they may be amended, updated or supplemented from time to time;

“Applicable Law” means any law, rule, statute, regulation, order, judgment, decree,
treaty, directive or other requirement in force at any time during the term of this
Agreement which applies to or is otherwise intended to govern or regulate any Person
(including any or all Parties), property, transaction, activity, event or other matter,
including any rule or other requirement of a SRO;

“Approved Participant” means both Approved Participant and Foreign Approved
Participant, as defined under the Rules;

“Business Day” means any day, other than Saturday, Sunday or any holiday upon which
the Designated Contracts are not opened for trading on the Bourse;

“Designated Contracts” means those contracts identified as such in Schedule A to this
Agreement;

“Market Making Program” means the Market Making Program described in the Bourse
Circular referred to in Schedule A to this Agreement;

“Person” means any individual, partnership, limited partnership, joint venture, syndicate,
sole proprietorship, company or corporation with or without share capital, unincorporated
association, trust, trustee, executor, administrator or other legal personal representative,
regulatory body or agency, government or governmental agency, authority or entity
however designated or constituted;

“Rules” means all the rules, policies and procedures of the Bourse and the instructions,
decisions and directions of the Bourse, in force and as amended from time to time;

“SRO” means a duly recognized self-regulatory organization having jurisdiction over any
of the Parties.



1.2.

Effective Date

The effective date of this Agreement shall be [®], 2022 (such day, the “Effective Date”).

1.3.

Interpretation

This Agreement shall be read in conjunction and interpreted in accordance with the Rules and the Market
Making Program. In case of an inconsistency between this Agreement and any of the Rules or the Market
Making Program, this Agreement will prevail.

1.4.

Schedules

The following schedules are attached to and form part of this Agreement:

1.5.

Schedule A: Designated Contracts and Market Making Responsibilities
Schedule B: Market Maker Information
Schedule C: Provisions Specific to Client Market Maker
Schedule D: Incentives
Currency

Except where otherwise expressly provided, all amounts in this Agreement are stated and will be paid in
Canadian currency.

2.1.

2.2,

2.3.

ARTICLE 2
OBLIGATIONS OF THE MARKET MAKER

During the term of this Agreement, the Market Maker agrees to act as Market Maker, within the
meaning of the Rules, and to be bound by and comply with the Rules, the Market Making Program
and this Agreement with respect to the Designated Contracts, including to fulfill the specific
obligations set forth in Schedule A (collectively, the “Market Making Responsibilities”). The
Market Maker will use commercially reasonable efforts to make the best markets possible for the
Designated Contracts having regards to all circumstances, throughout the trading day, and will at
a minimum comply with the Market Making Responsibilities. The Bourse reserves the right to
amend Schedule A at its entire discretion from time to time, including to adjust parameters in
light of changing market conditions, and shall give prior written notice of at least 30 days to the
Market Maker of such amendments.

The Market Maker shall perform its Market Making Responsibilities in a way as to foster fair and
orderly markets, to supply liquidity, to contribute to price efficiency and discovery, to provide as
much support as reasonably possible in times of stress to minimize episodes of temporary
illiquidity and price dislocation and to maintain a high level of investor confidence.

The Market Maker will appoint one or several individuals within the Market Marker’s firm to
carry out Market Making Responsibilities (a “Designated Trader”). However, only one
assignment per Designated Contract will be granted to the Market Maker and therefore, no more
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24.

2.5.

2.6.

2.7.

3.1.

than one Designated Trader at the same time can carry out Market Making Responsibilities with
respect to a Designated Contract. The Market Maker will also appoint one or several individuals
within the Market Maker’s firm to manage the Market Making Responsibilities and be the
primary contact with the Bourse with respect to the performance of this Agreement (a
“Designated Contact”). Designated Contacts will be responsible for, among others, managing
performance obligations and notifying the Bourse of any change to the information provided in
Schedule B. At least one Designated Contact must be available during trading hours. The Market
Maker shall notify the Exchange within 10 Business Days in the event of any change to the
information in this Agreement, including notice of a new Designated Contact or a new Designated
Trader or other changes to the information provided in Schedule B. Unless expressly agreed to
in writing by the Bourse, the same individual may not be appointed as a Designated Trader and a
Designated Contact at once.

The Market Maker shall promptly notify the Bourse’s Market Operations Department when it
becomes aware of its temporary inability or incapacity to perform its Market Making
Responsibilities for any reason, including such as unavailability of its Designated Trader or
technical issues. In such a case, the Market Maker shall use commercially reasonable efforts to
take all actions necessary to resume performance of its Market Making Responsibilities as soon
as practicable.

The Market Maker, directly or through its clearing member (responsible for the allocation
process), will set up and identify under Schedule B a sub-account that can be recognized by the
Bourse for the allocation of transactions resulting from market making activity on the Designated
Contracts under this Agreement as well as a Multi-Purpose sub-account (i.e. client netted
account) at CDCC (all such accounts, the “Designated Sub-Accounts”). All transactions
resulting from market making activity on the Designated Contracts under this Agreement shall
be allocated to, and only to, the Designated Sub-Accounts, and only such transactions shall be
considered by the Bourse for purposes of evaluating the performance of the Market Maker.

The Market Maker shall immediately advise the Bourse’s Market Operations Department if it
becomes aware of any issues that may impact the fair and orderly trade of its Designated
Contracts, including, but not limited to, unusual trading practices.

If, and only if, the Market Maker is not an Approved Participant of the Bourse, it shall also be
bound by the further provisions specific to client market maker set forth in Schedule C.

ARTICLE 3
TEMPORARY MEASURES AND EXEMPTIONS

In exceptional circumstances, the Bourse may, at its entire discretion, if it deems it necessary in
light of any particular or special market condition, temporarily suspend or vary the Market
Making Responsibilities either upon its own initiative or at the request of a market maker active
on the Designated Contracts (the “Temporary Measures™).



3.2

3.3.

4.1.

4.2.

4.3.

5.1.

If any Temporary Measure is taken pursuant to Section 3.1, the Bourse shall promptly notify all
market makers acting on the Designated Contracts and the market of the nature of such
Temporary Measures, including the applicability and length thereof.

Subject to notifying the Bourse as soon as possible, the Market Maker has no obligation to comply
with its Market Making Responsibilities with respect to a Designated Contract where:

(a) The relevant underlying interest’s trading has been halted, is otherwise not trading or the
liquidity of which is otherwise unusually negatively affected;

(b) A corporate announcement or another corporate event is affecting the relevant underlying
interest;

(c) There is unusual volatility in the underlying;

(d) The option class, as the case may be, is in the process of being de-listed by the Bourse.

ARTICLE 4
PERFORMANCE EVALUATION

The Bourse is solely responsible for making determinations with respect to performance of its
obligations by the Market Maker. The Bourse will consider all information it deems relevant
when assessing the performance of the Market Maker, including market conditions. Such
determinations are final and binding on all Parties.

Failure to meet any obligation under this Agreement may lead to, at the Bourse’s entire discretion:
(a) Reduction or denial of Incentives or portion thereof for the relevant period;

(b) Removal of the relevant Designated Contracts from the Market Making Responsibilities,
temporarily or for the remainder of the Term;

(©) Suspension or termination of this Agreement.

The Market Maker agrees to be publicly referred to and named as a Market Maker for the
Designated Contracts, including on the Bourse’s website.

ARTICLE §
INCENTIVES

In consideration of the performance of the Market Making Responsibilities for the relevant
period, the Bourse, and CDCC as the case may be, will provide the Market Maker with the
incentives detailed in Schedule D (the “Incentives”). The Bourse reserves the right to amend
Schedule D at its entire discretion from time to time and shall give prior written notice of at least
30 days to the Market Maker of such amendments.



5.2.

5.3.

54.

6.1.

6.2.

6.3.

6.4.

6.5.

In addition to the Incentives, the Market Maker may also be entitled to certain special fees or
rebates set out in the Bourse’s and CDCC'’s respective List of Fees posted on their website.
Subject to regulatory requirements, the List of Fees may be amended from time to time.

In order to assist the Market Maker with its Market Making Responsibilities, the Bourse may also
make available to the Market Maker certain functional features, including for example bulk
quoting.

The Bourse and CDCC are solely responsible for making determinations with respect to
Incentives to be paid under this Agreement in light of the performance of the obligations. Such
determinations are final and binding on all Parties.

ARTICLE 6
TERM, RENEWAL AND TERMINATION

Subject to the early termination rights provided hereunder, this Agreements shall commence on
the Effective Date and shall be in force for one year (the “Initial Term”).

At the expiry or the Initial Term and subsequently to any Renewal Term, this Agreement shall be
automatically renewed for one additional year (such renewal, a “Renewal Term”).

The Bourse or the Market Maker may terminate this Agreement for any reason upon a 30-day
prior written notice to the other Parties. Notwithstanding the preceding sentence, the Market
Maker may not send any termination notice within the 90-day period following the Effective
Date. A termination notice from any Party shall not terminate or relieve the Market Maker from
any Market Making Responsibilities which shall continue up to the effective date of termination.

The Bourse may terminate this Agreement immediately upon written notice if:

(a) the Market Maker has breached a material provision of this Agreement or has failed to
comply with any of its obligation hereunder, including any of its Market Making
Responsibilities;

(b) any statement made, representation given or information provided by the Market Maker
to the Bourse in connection with the Market Making Program or this Agreement is
erroneous or inaccurate in any material respect;

(c) the Bourse makes a determination in its sole judgment, which shall be final and binding
on the Parties, that the circumstances notified by the Market Maker in compliance with
Section 8.3, or any other circumstances concerning the Market Maker, its Designated
Traders or its Designated Contacts, are of the nature as to adversely impact the Bourse,
its reputation or investor confidence.

The Bourse or CDCC may terminate or amend this Agreement forthwith upon written notice to
the Market Maker in order to comply with an Applicable Law that has come into force after the



7.1.

7.2.

date hereof or at the request of a regulator having jurisdiction over the Bourse or CDCC
respectively.

ARTICLE 7
NO EXCLUSIVITY

Nothing in this Agreement shall preclude the Bourse from granting other market maker
assignments on the Designated Contract to third parties in accordance with the terms of the
Market Making Program. The rights to make markets on the Designated Contracts granted
hereunder to the Market Maker are not exclusive.

Nothing in this Agreement shall preclude the Market Maker from acting as a market maker on
any other exchanges, provided that it does not impair its performance of the Market Making
Responsibilities.

ARTICLE 8
REPRESENTATIONS, WARRANTIES AND COVENANTS

The Market Maker represents, warrants and undertakes the following:

8.1.

8.2.

8.3.

9.1.

It complies and will continue to comply with the eligibility and selection criteria under the Rules
and the Market Making Program.

It has the right and the authority to enter into this Agreement and it is not party to any other
Agreement that prohibits it from concluding or performing its obligations hereunder.

The Market Maker will promptly notify the Bourse if the Market Maker or one of its Designated
Traders or Designated Contacts is convicted of a crime, an offense or an infraction in connection
with trading in securities or derivative instruments under any Applicable Law, or if the Market
Maker or one of its Designated Traders or Designated Contacts has its securities or derivatives
registration or license suspended or revoked under any Applicable Law.

ARTICLE 9
LIMITATION OF LIABILITIES

Subject to the Rules, the Bourse and CDCC, their Affiliates, subsidiaries, related entities, and
their respective directors, officers, shareholders, partners, employees, contractors, agents,
representatives or related entities, shall not be liable for any loss or claim, including without
limitation, loss of profits, loss of opportunity, loss of use, trading losses, loss of other costs or
savings, nor for any damages suffered, or cost or expenses incurred by the Market Maker or any



10.1.

10.2.

10.3.

10.4.

third party as a result of the performance by the Market Maker of its obligations hereunder or a
failure to perform those obligations.

ARTICLE 10
MISCELLENEOUS

Assignment. A party to this Agreement may not assign any of its rights or obligations under this
Agreement without the prior written consent of the other Parties, which consent shall not be
unreasonably withheld. The Market Maker may request that one of'its Affiliates exercise or fulfill
part of its obligations under this Agreement upon notification to the Bourse in writing. However,
even if the Bourse consents, in such a case, the Market Maker shall remain responsible and liable
at all times for all of the obligations hereunder as if it was performing them itself.

Disclosure. The Market Maker recognizes that as regulated entities, the Bourse and CDCC are
subject to oversight by a number of securities and derivatives regulators in Canada and abroad.
The Bourse and CDCC may disclose the present Agreement and any information related thereto
to any regulator having jurisdiction over them, including information regarding the performance
of the Market Making Responsibilities.

Entire Agreement, Waiver, Amendment. This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement
between the Parties with respect to the subject matter of this Agreement. No amendment or waiver
of this Agreement will be binding unless executed in writing by the Party to be bound thereby.
No waiver of any provision of this Agreement constitutes a waiver of any other provision and no
waiver of any provision of this Agreement constitutes a continuing waiver unless otherwise
expressly provided. Any failure by the Bourse to insist at any time upon the performance of any
of the terms, provisions or undertakings of the Market Maker contained in this Agreement or to
exercise any rights thereunder shall not constitute or be construed as a waiver thereof or a
relinquishment of the Bourse’s rights to require the future performance of any such term,
provision or undertaking and the obligation of the Market Maker with regard to the same shall
continue in full force and effect.

Notices. Any written notice or other written communication required or permitted to be given
under this Agreement will be given by facsimile or other means of electronic communication
with delivery receipt confirmation or by first-class mail or personal delivery as provided below.
Communication will be deemed to have been received on the Business Day following the sending
or, if delivered by hand, will be deemed to have been received at the time it is delivered to the
applicable address noted below either to the individual designated below or to an individual at
that address having apparent authority to accept deliveries on behalf of the addressee. Notice of
change of address is also governed by this Section. Notices and other communications will be
addressed as follows:

(a) If to the Bourse:

Bourse de Montréal Inc.



10.5.

10.6.

10.7.

10.8.

10.9.

1800 - 1190 avenue des Canadiens-de-Montréal, C. P. 37
Montréal, Québec, H3B 0G7

Attention: Mr. Robert Tasca

Email: robert.tasca@tmx.com

A copy of any Notice sent to the Bourse shall also be sent to the same address, attention to Legal
Affairs or at legal@tmx.com.

(b) If to the Market Maker:

Attention:
Email: |

Survival. ARTICLE 9 as well as any other provision required to give effect thereto will survive
the expiration or termination of this Agreement.

Governing Law and Jurisdiction. This Agreement is governed exclusively by, and is to be
enforced, construed and interpreted exclusively in accordance with, the laws of the Province of
Quebec and the laws of Canada applicable therein which will be deemed to be the proper law of
the Agreement. Subject to the Rules, each party hereto irrevocably attorns to the jurisdiction of
the Province of Quebec sitting in Montreal, Quebec and the proper appeal courts therefrom in
respect to all matters arising under or in relation to this Agreement.

Force Majeure. None of the Parties may be considered in default for failing to perform
obligations hereunder nor liable for the damages or losses incurred by the other Parties if such
non-performance, damages, or losses result from force majeure or extraordinary events. Without
limiting the generality of the foregoing, force majeure or extraordinary events shall mean: any
partial or complete work stoppages, strikes, lock-outs, fires, riots, disasters, wars, catastrophes,
inabilities to procure materials or labour, any other similar events or any circumstances not
attributable to another Party hereto, or any other states of emergency or causes which may be
considered at law as being beyond the control of any Party hereto.

Severability. Should a provision hereof be declared invalid or of no effect by a court having
jurisdiction, the invalidity or lack of effect of such provision shall not impair the validity or effect
of the other provisions hereof which shall remain in full force and effect.

Counterparts. This Agreement may be signed in counterparts and each counterpart constitutes
an original document and the counterparts, taken together, constitute one and the same
instrument. Delivery of counterparts may be made by facsimile transmission and/or by email
transmission of a PDF document.
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF the Parties have executed this Agreement on the dates indicated below.

Executed by the Bourse on this | of

BOURSE DE MONTREAL INC.

By:

Name:
Title:

Executed by the Market Maker on this __of

, 20

,20 .

[NAME OF MARKET MAKER]

By

H\Iame:
Title:

INTERVENTION BY CDCC

CDCC hereby intervenes to this Agreement with respect only to the Incentives it may be providing to
the Market Maker with respect to clearing fees, if and as set forth under Schedule D.

Executed by CDCC on this of

CANADIAN DERIVATIVES CLEARING
CORPORATION

By:

Name: Jean-Francois
Title: President

Bertrand

10
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SCHEDULE A

DESIGNATED CONTRACTS AND
MARKET MAKER RESPONSIBILITIES

Designated Contracts: Equity and ETF options classes assigned to the Market Maker by the
Bourse at any given time. The Market Maker can request options
classes for assignment or relinquish options classes’ assignment by
communicating with the Bourse’s Market Operations Department. A
Market Maker must be assigned at least 50 classes to maintain its
status as a Market Maker.

Market Maker Responsibilities
I.  Definitions:
The Market Maker must post a two-sided market in accordance with the following conditions:

A. Pre-opening obligation:
Definition of the pre-opening phase: The official pre-opening phase starts at 5:30
a.m. and ends at 9:30 a.m. for equity and ETF options.

The Market Maker has no obligation to provide continuous two-sided quotes in the
pre-opening phase.

B. Opening obligation:

Definition of the opening phase: The regular trading session of the Bourse’s options
market starts at 9:30 a.m. for equity and ETF options. Each individual option class
is automatically open for trading once a trade has been executed on the underlying
security on a recognized Canadian exchange. If no trade has been executed on the
underlying security, the option class is automatically open for trading at 9:35 a.m.
Until such time as an option class is open for trading, the option class will remain
in a pre-opening phase.

The Market Maker must submit a Valid Quote (as defined below) within 5 seconds
of the opening of the option class.

C. Continuous trading phase obligation:
Definition of the continuous trading phase: The continuous trading session of the
Bourse’s options market starts when options classes are open for trading. The
continuous trading session ends at 4 p.m. for equity and ETF options.

The Market Maker must submit a Valid Quote (as defined below) during the
continuous trading session.
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D. Closing obligation:
Definition of the closing phase: The regular trading session of the Bourse’s option
market closes at 4 p.m. for equity and ETF options.

The Market Maker must post a Valid Quote (as defined below) upon closing, in
order to ensure a good order of end-of-day activities.

E. Valid Quote:

For a quote to be considered valid (a “Valid Quote™), the quote must meet both the
following criteria:

1) Minimum size: The posted size on both the bid and ask is at least (x) number
of contracts.

2) Maximum spread: The posted bid and ask prices have a differential of no more
than (y) number of instrument ticks measured in dollars.
If no bid is provided, the spread is calculated as the difference between zero and
the first ask price provided by the Market Maker.

F. Rate of presence: The period of time during which the Market Maker is posting a
Valid Quote throughout the trading session. It is calculated as a percentage.

G. Grace Period: The amount of time during which the Market Maker would not be
required to post a valid quote following a trade. This disruption to the quoting
obligations will not count against the Market Maker’s rate of presence. If a trade
triggering a grace period occurs during an ongoing grace period, then a new grace
period would commence.

II.  Basic quoting requirements:
1) For all options expiration, at the open:
a) Valid Quote:

e Maximum spread: $5
e Minimum size: 5 contracts

b) Rate of presence:
At least 60% of the time on all assigned instruments at the open.

c) Grace period: 3 seconds

2) For options with weekly expiration and monthly expiration greater than 3 months and
equal or less than 9 months:

a) Valid Quote:
e Maximum spread: $5
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e Minimum size: 5 contracts

b) Rate of presence:
At least 80% of the continuous trading session on all series of appointed classes
that have weekly expiration and monthly expiration greater than 3 months and equal
or less than 9 months

c) Grace period: 3 seconds

3) For options with monthly expiration equal or less than 3 months, excluding weekly
expiration:

i) During the continuous trading session
a) Quoting criteria:
During the continuous trading session, the quoting criteria on options with

expiration equal or less than 3 months, excluding weekly expiration, are
defined by the maximum spread and the minimum size in the table below:

Bid price Maximum spread | Minimum size
(contracts)

$0-$2.00* $0.50 10
$2.01-$5.00 $0.80 10
$5.01-$10.00 $1.20 10
$10.01-$20.00 $2 10
$20.01-$50.00 $3 10
$50.00 and above $5 10

*Options with no bid are subject to the same spread obligations.
b) Rate of presence:
At least 80% of the continuous trading session on all series of appointed
classes that have an expiration equal or less than 3 months, excluding
weekly expiration.

c) Grace period: 3 seconds

ii) At the Close
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a) Quoting criteria:
At the close, the quoting criteria on all options with expiration equal or less
than 3 months, excluding weekly expiration, are defined by the maximum
spread and the minimum size in the table below:

Bid price Maximum spread | Minimum size
(contracts)

$0-$2.00* $0.50 1
$2.01-$5.00 $0.80 1
$5.01-$10.00 $1.20 1
$10.01-$20.00 $2 1
$20.01-$50.00 $3 1
$50.00 and above $5 1

*Options with no bid are subject to the same spread obligations.

b) Rate of presence:
At least 80% of all series of appointed classes that have an expiration equal
or less than 3 months, excluding weekly expiration.

c) Grace period: 3 seconds

III. Quoting criteria to qualify for the incentive program:
1) During the continuous trading session, for options with weekly expiration and
expiration greater than 3 months and equal or less than 9 months:

a) Quoting criteria:
During the continuous trading session, the quoting criteria for all options
with weekly expiration and expiration greater than 3 months and equal or
less than 9 months are defined by the maximum spread and the minimum
size in the table below:

Bid price Maximum spread | Minimum size
(contracts)
$0-$2.00* $0.50 10
$2.01-$5.00 $0.80 10
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$5.01-$10.00 $1.20 10

$10.01-$20.00 $2 10
$20.01-$50.00 $3 10
$50.00 and above $5 10

*Options with no bid are subject to the same spread obligations.

b) Rate of presence:
At least 60% of the continuous trading session on all series of appointed
classes that have an expiration greater than 3 months and equal or less than
9 months.

c) Grace period: 3 seconds

2) At the close for options with weekly expiration and monthly expiration greater than 3
months:

a) Quoting criteria:
At the close, the quoting criteria for all options with weekly expiration and monthly
expiration greater than 3 months are defined by the maximum spread and the
minimum size in the table below:

Bid price Maximum spread | Minimum size
(contracts)

$0-$2.00* $0.50 1
$2.01-$5.00 $0.80 1
$5.01-$10.00 $1.20 1
$10.01-$20.00 $2 1
$20.01-$50.00 $3 1
$50.00 and above $5 1

*Options with no bid are subject to the same spread obligations.
b) Rate of presence:

At least 60% on all series of appointed classes that have weekly expiration and
monthly expiration greater than 3 months
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c) Grace period: 3 seconds

3) During the continuous trading for options with expiration greater than 9 months:

IV.

a) During the continuous trading session, the quoting criteria for all options with

expiration greater than 9 months are defined by the following spread and size:
e Maximum spread: $9
e Minimum size: 5 contracts

b) Rate of presence:

At least 60% of the continuous trading session on all series of appointed classes
with expiration greater than 9 months.

c) Grace period: 3 seconds

Other privileges:
As long as the Market Maker meets the basic quoting requirements defined in
Section I, it will be entitled to the following privileges:

A.
B.

Bulk Quote messages (BQ)

Panic Quote channel (PQ): This connection provides the Market Maker with a way
to pull their quotes out of the market instantly by sending Global Cancellation
messages.

Order Routing channel (OR)

Messaging throughput: The Market Maker on Equity & ETF options will have the
following messaging throughput capabilities:

> 50 assignments 3000 MPS for each BQ connection

PQ channels 1000 MPS for each PQ connection

Any other connection: 600 MPS per connection

Bulk Quotes Management Tool: allows the Market Maker to manage the risk
related to bulk quoting.

Market Makers execution and clearing fees: The Market Maker will be entitled to
reduced execution and clearing fees as per MX fee schedule.

Performance:

The Market Maker will have access to daily performance reports on an SFTP server in
order to monitor its compliance with the requirements. The Market Maker will be
notified on a quarterly basis if it does not meet the basic quoting requirements described
in section II (basic quoting requirements) on any given assigned class. The Bourse
reserves the right to terminate the assignment on the class on which the Market Maker
didn’t meet such requirements for two consecutive quarters.
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SCHEDULE B

MARKET MAKER INFORMATION

Designated Trader(s)

Name:

Trader Identification
Number:

Designated Contact(s)

Name:

Title:

Telephone:

Email:

Designated Sub-Accounts

Bourse Sub-Account
Number:

CDCC Multi-Purpose Sub-
Account Number:

Name of CDCC Clearing
Member, if the
Market Maker is not
itself a clearing
member:
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SCHEDULE C

PROVISIONS SPECIFIC TO CLIENT MARKET MAKER

The Market Maker represents and warrants that it has direct electronic access to the
Bourse through an Approved Participant of the Bourse in accordance with the Rules of
the Bourse and that it complies with the Rules governing direct electronic access to the
Bourse.

The Market Maker acknowledges and accepts the authority of the Bourse, as an SRO, to
adopt and amend Rules, subject to Applicable Law, and to enforce such Rules, including
imposing disciplinary measures to the Market Maker in the event of a violation of the
Regulations of the Bourse.

With respect to its market making related trading activity, the Market Maker
acknowledges and accepts the investigative, enforcement and disciplinary jurisdiction of
the Regulatory Division of the Bourse and of its committees to hear and decide as
contemplated under the Rules any matter concerning the Market Maker, its directors,
officers, employees and other individual acting on its behalf, as if the Market Maker was
itself an Approved Participant of the Bourse with such modifications as the circumstances
require. For the avoidance of doubt, the Regulatory Division shall be entitled to enforce
the Rules and take any action permitted under the Rules directly against the Market
Maker with respect to its market making related trading activity, including without
limitation under Part 4 of the Rules, articles 6.3, 6.114, 6.115, 6.118, 6.119, 6.120, 6.209,
6.210, 6.309, 7.5, 7.6, 7.7 and following on position limits, 12.7 and following on
position limits, 3.100, 3.110, 4.1, 6.10 and 6.11 as these articles may be amended and/or
replaced from time to time.

The Market Maker accepts responsibility for maintaining at all times a thorough
understanding of the Rules and ensuring that all individuals acting on its behalf with
respect to the Market Making Responsibilities will familiarize themselves with the Rules.

The Market Maker acknowledges and accepts that it shall remain subject to the
jurisdiction of the Bourse and of its committees as contemplated herein after ceasing to
be a market maker in regards to matters which occurred while it was a market maker, the
whole in accordance with the Rules.

The Market Maker undertakes to pay the Bourse on demand the amount of any fine and
all the fees imposed on the Market Maker by a decision of the Bourse or one of its
committees with respect to its market making related trading activity. These sums will
bear interest at a yearly rate, as determined by the Bourse from time to time.
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SCHEDULE C

INCENTIVES

Market Maker Competitive Liquidity Incentive Program

The Market Maker Competitive Liquidity Incentive Program (the “Program™) is an incentive
program that rewards market makers based on the services they provide and their activity in the
options market. In order to be eligible for this program, the Market Maker must meet the quoting
requirements defined in Schedule A, Section II of this Agreement.

For any given month while the Program is effective, all equity and ETF options market makers
eligible for the Program will collectively receive $60,000, shared among them based on their
performance which will be evaluated based on the criteria described below. This amount could be
increased by the Bourse based on the growth of the retail segment of the options market.

The Program is designed to reward market makers based on several quantitative metrics.

1) Monthly market maker volume “MMMV” - (30%)

2) Rate of presence with a valid quote in <9 months options “RP1” - (25%)
3) Rate of presence at the close “RP2” - (20%)

4) Rate of presence with a valid quote in > 9 months options “RP3” - (10%)
5) Number of assigned option classes “AOC” - (15%)

Once all the metrics are calculated along with their weights, a final score reflecting the Market
Maker’s share of the pool of incentive will be generated based on the formulas below:

1) Monthly Market Maker volume
MMMV = MM traded volume + )] (all MM Volume) x 30% weight

2) Rate of presence on options with expiration equal or less than 9 months: The Market Maker’s
average monthly rate of presence will be compared against the total average monthly rate
of presence of all the eligible market makers.

RP1=MM average rate of presence + Y, (all eligible MMs average rate of presence) x 25% weight

3) Rate of presence at the close: The Market Maker’s average monthly rate of presence at the close
will be compared against the total average rate of presence of all the eligible market makers.

RP2 = MM rate of presence at the close + Y, (all MMs average rate of presence at the close) x 20%
weight
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4) Rate of presence on options with expiration greater than 9 months: The Market Maker’s monthly
average rate of presence will be compared against the total average rate of presence of all
the eligible market makers.

RP3 = MM average rate of presence long term options + Y, (all eligible MMs average rate of
presence long term options) x 10% weight

5) Number of assigned classes: The Market Maker’s total number of assigned classes will be
compared to the total number of assigned classes of all the eligible market makers on a
month-end basis.

AOC = MM number of assigned option classes + Y, (number of assigned options classes per
eligible MM) x 15% weight
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